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Preston Rowe Paterson (PRP) demonstrates ongoing commitment to Information
Security Management and Client confidence.
 
Preston Rowe Paterson, Australia’s prominent firm of property valuers, analysts, advisers
and consultants has announced today that it has been awarded ISO 27001 certification.
Recognised as the international standard for best practices in information security
management systems (ISMS), ISO 27001 certification clearly demonstrates PRP’s
commitment to providing their customers with the highest level of information security
management. 
 
“Achieving ISO 27001 certification recognises PRP’s impeccable security standards and
continues to reassure to our customers, shareholders and business partners that we
prioritise protection of their data.” said Greg Sugars, PRP CEO & National Director.
“Following an extensive audit process, we were pleased to meet the rigorous standards
required for ISO 27001 certification and accreditation. Having this on paper just confirms
PRPs ongoing commitment to the highest levels of transparency and data security.” 
 
Greg says; “PRP’s Online software system is industry-leading and our data systems have
always been protected by Tier3 Data Centres in Australia. Having the ISO 27001
certification is simply the icing on the cake.” 
 
What is ISO 27001 certification?
ISO 27001 is a stringent international standard published jointly by the International
Organisation for Standardization (ISO) and the International Electro Technical
Commission (IEC).
ISO 27001 mandates controls to establish, maintain, certify and ensure continual
improvement of an ISMS. Certified organisations have established protocols to protect
information assets from any cyber threats such as criminal activity, fraud, user errors and
external parties. 
 
Preston Rowe Paterson and ISO 27001
As Australia and New Zealand’s elite supplier of investment, development and asset
property valuation services, PRP’s decision to seek ISO 27001 accreditation demonstrates
their ongoing commitment to their relentless focus on excellence. “This is fantastic news
for our industry and gives our Clients complete assurance that we at PRP operate to the
highest quality standards. It continues PRP’s long history of putting our Clients first”. 
Greg Sugars, National Director of PRP.
 
About Preston Rowe Paterson
Established in Sydney in 1988, Preston Rowe Paterson is a leading firm of property
valuers, analysts, advisers and consultants who operate throughout Australia and New
Zealand, with links globally. PRP is recognised as an elite supplier of investment,
development and asset property services. PRP’s culture of continuous improvement
means that PRP has always shown leadership in standardising quality, reliability and
safety processes throughout the organisation.


